SCHEDULE FOR RDCS COMPETITION MANUAL

Date	Meeting	Time (hrs)	RDCS Material	Agenda
10/11/2016	Workshop	3.5	2nd Draft	Section I and II
10/18/2016	Workshop	7.5	2nd Draft	Section III: 1, 2
11/1/2016	Workshop	7.5	2nd Draft	Section III: 3, 4
11/15/2016	Workshop	7.5	2nd Draft	Section III: 5, 6, 7, 8
11/22/2016	Workshop	5.0	2nd Draft	Section III: 8, 9
11/29/2016	Workshop	7.5	2nd Draft	Section III: 9, 6 and Implementation
12/6/2016	Workshop	7.5	3rd Draft	Implementation; All Sections
12/13/2016	Workshop	5.5	3rd Draft / Proposed Test	Section III: 9, Points
1/10/2017	Workshop	3.5	3rd Draft	Section III 9 Points; Implementation
1/17/2017	Workshop	2.5	Proposed Test	Approve Test; Implementation Policies
1/24/2017	Workshop	3.0	4th Draft	Section IV Implementation Policies
1/25/2017	CC Meeting	0.5		Progress Report
2/7/2017	Workshop	5.5	Test Results	Review Test Results, Adjustments to Section III

SCHEDULE FOR RDCS COMPETITION MANUAL

Date	Meeting	Time (hrs)	RDCS Material	Agenda
2/21/2017	Workshop	5.0	Test Results	Review Manual Section III Scoring
2/28/2017	Workshop	5.5	4th Draft	Review Manual Section III Scoring, Section IV Implementation Policies
3/7/2017	Workshop	5.0	4th Draft	Review Manual All Sections
3/14/2017	PC Hearing	1.0		Evaluation and Recommendation on Available Allotments/On-going
4/5/2017	CC Meeting	0.5		Progress Report and Determination on Possible Reduction to Allotments
4/11/2017	PC Hearing	2.0	Final Draft	Recommendation to City Council
5/3/2017	CC Hearing	1.0	Final Draft	Adopt Competition Manual